SPECIFICATIONS
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ROCK SALT

Bid No. 19007SWOPA4G

SOUTHWEST OHIO
PURCHASERS FOR GOVERNMENT

* ko k%

it Sal LL
Company Name: Detroit Salt Company, LLC

Contact Person: __ Jean Szatkowski

Address: 12841 Sanders Street

City, State, & Zip: Detroit, MI 48217

Phone No: 313:8415144 /Fax No: 313.841.1102

***Bid Opening time/Date: 3:00 P.M. local (Dayton OH) time on
June 25, 2019%**



19007SWOP4G BID PRICING PAGES

Please provide a delivered price for the salt from origin to the INDIVIDUAL ENTITIES.

FREIGHT IS TO BE INCLUDED. Also list the stockpile and mine to be used for each location.

Bidders are to submit one (1) original copy signed by an officer authorized to bind the company, Excel spreadsheet and one (1) electronic flash drive of signed bid and Excel

spreadsheet.
Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company
. . % Available
Iﬁf Orzanization f")‘::;‘i;t‘i % Stockpile/Mine Location over maximum

1 |Batavia Township 600 NO BID

2  |Bath Township 700 NO BID

3 |Beavercreek Township 1,200 NO BID

4 |Beavercreek, City of 8,000 NO BID

5 |Bellbrook, City of 700 NO BID

6 |Blendon Township 300 NO BID

7 |Brookville, City of 500 87.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
8 |Butler Township 2,000 87.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
9 |Cardington, Village of 100 NO BID

10 |Cedarville, Village of 275 NO BID

11 |Central Ohio Transit Authority (COTA) 400 NO BID

12 [Clearcreek Township 1,800 NO BID

13 |Clermont County Engineer’s Office 3,000 NO BID

14 |Clinton Township 300 NO BID

15 |Concord Township 900 NO BID

16 [Dayton City Schools 100 84.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
17 |Dayton, City of 10,000 90.37 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
18 |Dublin, City of 2,000 NO BID

19 |Englewood, City of 1,200 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
20 |Evendale, Village of 700 NO BID
21 |Farmersville, Village of 150 NO BID
22 |Gahanna, City of 3,000 NO BID
23 |Genoa Township 600 NO BID
24 |Germantown, City of 300 89.15 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
25 |Gilead Township (Morrow County) 100 NO BID
26 |Glendale, Village of 300 NO BID
27 |Goshen Township 600 NOBID

28 |Grandview Heights, City of 750 NO BID

29 |Greater Dayton RTA 200 84.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
30 |Greene County Engineer 7,500 NO BID

31 |Hamilton, City of 4,000 NOBID

32 |Harlem Township 250 NO BID

33 |Harrison Township, 1,000 90.37 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
34 |Hilliard, City of 2,000 NO BID

35 |Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 NO BID

36 |Jackson Township 150 84.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%




Please provide a delivered price for the salt from origin to the INDIVIDUAL ENTITIES.

19007SWOP4G BID PRICING PAGES

FREIGHT IS TO BE INCLUDED. Also list the stockpile and mine to be used for each location.

Bidders are to submit one (1) original copy signed by an officer authorized to bind the company, Excel spreadsheet and one (1) electronic flash drive of signed bid and Excel

spreadsheet.
Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company
. . % Available
I;f Orsanization TE:?:—;:::’S % Stockpile/Mine Location over maximum
37 |Jefferson Township 300 $ 90.37 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
38 |[Kettering, City of 4,800 NO BID
39 |Mad River Local Schools 120 $ 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
40 |Mason, City of 5,000 NO BID
41 |Miami County Engineers Office 5,000 NO BID
42 |Miami Township (Clermont County) 2,700 NOBID
43 |Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,500 S 92.70 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
44 |Miamisburg, City of 3,500 89.15 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
45 |Middletown, City of 4,500 NO BID
46 |Milford, City of 700 NO BID
47 |Monroe, City of 3,000 NO BID
48 |Montgomery County Engineer 10,000 84.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
49 |Montgomery County Parks 100 90.37 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
50 [Moraine, City of 1,500 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
51 [Mount Gilead, Village 100 NO BID
52 |New Albany, City of 500 NO BID
53 |New Carlisle, City of 300 NO BID
54 |New Jasper Township 400 NO BID
55 |Oakwood, City of 800 S 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
56 |Obetz, Village of 400 NO BID
57 |Pierce Township 1,000 NO BID
58 |Piqua, City of 2,000 NOBID
59 |Powell, City of 1,000 NO BID
60 |Riverside, City of 1,400 S 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
61 |Sharonville, City of 1,200 NO BID
62 |St. Bernard, Village of 600 NO BID
63 |Stonelick Township 350 NO BID
64 |Sugarcreek Township 1,000 NO BID
65 |Tate Township (Clermont County) 200 NO BID
66 |Trenton, City of 600 NO BID
67 |Trotwood, City of 1,500 S 90.98 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
68 |Union Township Trustees 1,200 NO BID
69 |Union, City of 600 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
70 |Vandalia, City of 2,000 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
71 |Washington Township 2,000 89.15 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
72 |Washington Township (Clermont County) 100 NO BID




19007SWOP4G BID PRICING PAGES

Please provide a delivered price for the salt from origin to the INDIVIDUAL ENTITIES.

FREIGHT IS TO BE INCLUDED. Also list the stockpile and mine to be used for each location.
Bidders are to submit one (1) original copy signed by an officer authorized to bind the company, Excel spreadsheet and one (1) electronic flash drive of signed bid and Excel

spreadsheet.
Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company
. . % Available
Iltlf- Organization %‘;‘;ﬁ % Stockpile/Mine Location over maximum
73 |West Carrollton, City of 1,000 S 89.15 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit 0%
74 | West Jefferson, Village of 500 NO BID
75 |West Milton, Municipality of 300 NO BID
76 |Whitehall, City of 5,000 NO BID
77 |Williamsburg Township 150 NO BID
78 |Worthington, City of 1,500 NO BID
79 |Xenia, City of 1,500 NO BID
80 |Xenia Township Board of Trustees 600 NO BID
81 [Village of Yellow Springs 320 NO BID
82 [Wright-Patterson AFB 2,100 NO BID




DAYTON

June 11, 2019

TO: Bidders on IFB 19007SWOP4G Rock Salt

FROM: City of Dayton, Ohio on behalf of SWOP4G
Division of Purchasing

SUBJECT: Addendum #1 to above IFB

On behalf of Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government (SWOP4G) this addendum is to announce and
serve as official notice that there are changes to the Invitation For Bid (IFB) No. 19007SWOP4G; Rock
Salt

1. Addition of a governmental agency to this bid

To ensure the integrity of the bid process, a signed copy of this addendum notice should be included
with any bid offered to the City of Dayton as a result of [IFB No. 19007SWOP4G.

Richelle Labut 06/24/19
(Print Name) (Date)
L L M T Wl Detroit Salt Company, LLC
(Signature) (Company Name)
Sincerely,

Donita Jo Garner, CPPB
Senior Buyer

1 IFB No. 19007SWOP4G Addendum 1
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Document A310™ _ 2010

Conforms with The American Institute of Architects AIA Document 310

Bid Bond

CONTRACTOR: SURETY:

Name, legal status and address) (Name, legal status and principal place of business)
The Detroit Salt Company Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland

i This document has important
12841 Sanders 1299 Zurich Way, 5th Floor legal consequences. Consultation
: . with an attorney is encouraged

Detroit, Ml 48217 Schaumburg, IL 60196-1056 with respect fo its completion or
OWNER: modification.
(Name, legal status and address) Any singular reference to

i Contractor, Surety, Owner or
City of Dayton other party shall be considered
101 W. Third St plural where applicable.

Dayton, OK 45402
BOND AMOUNT: $ 5% Five Percent of Amount Bid
PROJECT:

(Name, location or address, and Project number, if any)

Bid No. 19007SWOP4G - Supply Approximately 25,000 tons of salt

The Contractor and Surety are bound to the Owner in the amount set forth above, for the payment of which the Contractor and Surety bind
themselves, their heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and severally, as provided hercin. The conditions of this
Bond are such that if the Owner aceepts the bid of the Contractor within the time speeified in the bid documents, or within such time period
as may be agreed to by the Owner and Contractor, and the Contractor either (1) enters into a contract with the Owner in accordance with
the terms of such bid, and gives such bond or bonds as may be specified in the bidding or Contract Documents, with a surety admitted in
the jurisdiction of the Project and otherwise acceptable to the Owner, for the faithful performance of such Contract and for the prompt
payment of labor and material fumished in the prosecution thereof: or (2) pays to the Owner the ditference, not to exceed the amount of
this Bond, between the amount specified in said bid and such larger amount for which the Qwner may in good faith contract with another
parly to perlorm the work covered by said bid, then this obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in (ull force and ellect. The
Surety hereby waives any notice ol an agreement between the Owner and Conlractor 1o extend the tinte in which the Qwner may aceept the
bid. Waiver ol notice by the Surety shall not apply to any extension exceeding sixty (60) days in the aggregate bevond the time lor
acceplance ol bids specilied in the bid documents, and the Owner and Contractor shall obtain the Surety’s consent for an extension beyond
sixly (60) days.

If this Bond is issued in connection with a subcontractor's bid to a Contractor, the term Contractor in this Bond shall be deemed fo be
Subcontractor and the term Owner shatl be deemed to be Contractor.

When this Bond has been lurnished to comply wilh a statutory or other legal requivement in the location of the Project, any provision in
this Bond conllicting with said statutory or legal requirement shall be deemed deleted herelrom and provisions conforming 1o such
statufory or other legal requirement shall be deemed incorporated herein. When so [umished, the intent is that this Bond shall be construed
as a statutory bond and not as a common law bond.

Signed and scaled this 25th day of June, 2019

s

P p The Detroit Salt Company
s \ ’/ / (Principal) (Seal)
(H-'lmess) S S N
BYJI J/."-*. "' A lI 4‘ {
(Tiile) PySrass Optmt ond ngr ’r ‘Q Bifd',

Fidelity and Deposit Company of Maryland ¢ a ;P"“'v\\ c;

. (Surety) . (sa%\« - ) E

L ] -

(Witness) “.!s Y ™

By irre 8%\ 1852 S

(TineyDelAnna M. Maurer Attorney-in-Fact ‘3’* g B

. ; T3 S
s T

S-0054/AS 8/10



Bond Number Bid Bond

Obligee City of Dayton

ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY
FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND
POWER OF ATTORNEY

KNOW ALL MEN BY THESE PRESENTS: That the ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY, a corporation of the State of New
York, the COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY, a carporation of the State of Illinois, and the FIDELITY
AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND a corporation of the State of Illinois (herein collectively called the "Companies"), by
Robert D. Murray, Vice President, in pursuance of authority granted by Article V, Section 8, of the By-Laws of said Companies, which are
set forth on the reverse side hereof and are hereby certified to be in full force and effect on the date hereof, do hereby nominate, constitute,
and appoint DeAnna M. Maurer - B , its true and lawful agent and Attorney-in-Fact, to make, execute,
seal and deliver, for, and on its behalf as surety, and as its act and deed: any and a1l bonds and undertakings, and the execution of such
bonds or undertakings in pursuance of these presents, shall be as binding upon said Companies, as fully and amply, to all intents and
purposes, as if they had been duly executed and acknowledged by the regularly elected officers of the ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE
COMPANY at its office in New York, New York., the regularly elected officers of the COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND
SURETY COMPANY at its office in Owings Mills, Maryland., and the regularly elected officers of the FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT
COMPANY OF MARYLAND at its office in Owings Mills, Maryland., in their own proper persons.

The said Vice President does hereby certify that the extract set forth on the reverse side hereof is a true copy of Article V, Section 8, of
the By-Laws of said Companies, and is now in force.

IN WITNESS WHEREQOF, the said Vice-President has hereunto subscribed his/her names and affixed the Corporate Seals of the said
ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY, COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY, and
FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND, this 24th day of January, A.D. 2019.

ATTEST:

ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY
FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND

2 -
.f;(_é__/ ::
By: Robert 5._Murray - -
Vice President

D € Grgun_

By: Dawn E. Brown
Secretary

kg .\“"‘
State of Maryland g

County of Baltimore

On this 24th day of January, A.D. 2019, before the subscriber, a Notary Public of the State of Maryland, duly commissioned and qualified, Robert D.
Murray, Vice President and Dawn E. Brown, Secretary of the Companies, to me personally known to be the individuals and officers described in and who
executed the preceding instrument, and acknowledged the execution of same, and being by me duly sworn, deposeth and saith, that he/she is the said officer of
the Company aforesaid, and that the seals affixed to the preceding instrument are the Corporate Seals of said Companies, and that the said Corporate Seals and
the signature as such officer were duly affixed and subscribed to the said instrument by the authority and direction of the said Corporations.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREQOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my Official Seal the day and year first above written.

112
°“‘a . .y,j’b

R
Y Tf‘:)c;\:\“?‘;z\ %

Shalas

§ 3

§ %

33T, oiid MQ.M

3 NIST .

5 S Y SSF e -

U i S Constance A. Dunn, Notary Public
g™ My Commission Expires: July 9, 2019



EXTRACT FROM BY-LAWS OF THE COMPANIES

“Article V, Section 8, Attornevs-in-Fact., The Chief Executive Officer, the President, or any Executive Vice President or Vice President
may, by written instrument under the attested corporate seal, appoint attorneys-in-fact with authority to execute bonds, policies,
recognizances, stipulations, undertakings, or other like instruments on behalf of the Company, and may authorize any officer or any such
attorney-in-fact to affix the corporate seal thereto; and may with or without cause modify of revoke any such appointment or authority at any

time."
CERTIFICATE

I, the undersigned, Vice President of the ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY, the COLONIAL AMERICAN
CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY, and the FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND, do hereby certify that the
foregoing Power of Attorney is still in full force and effect on the date of this certificate; and I do further certify that Article V, Section 8, of
the By-Laws of the Companies is still in force.

This Power of Attorney and Certificate may be signed by facsimile under and by authority of the following resolution of the Board of
Directors of the ZURICH AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY at a meeting duly called and held on the 15th day of December 1998.

RESOLVED: "That the signature of the President or a Vice President and the attesting signature of a Secretary or an Assistant Secretary
and the Seal of the Company may be affixed by facsimile on any Power of Attorney...Any such Power or any certificate thereof bearing such
facsimile signature and seal shall be valid and binding on the Company.”

This Power of Attorney and Certificate may be signed by facsimile under and by authority of the following resolution of the Board of
Directors of the COLONIAL AMERICAN CASUALTY AND SURETY COMPANY at a meeting duly called and held on the 5th day of
May, 1994, and the following resolution of the Board of Directors of the FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND at a
meeting duly called and held on the 10th day of May, 1990.

RESOLVED: "That the facsimile or mechanically reproduced seal of the company and facsimile or mechanically reproduced signature
of any Vice-President, Secretary, or Assistant Secretary of the Company, whether made heretofore or hereafter, wherever appearing upon a
certified copy of any power of attomey issued by the Company, shall be valid and binding upon the Company with the same force and effect
as though manually affixed,

IN TESTIMONY WHEREQF, I have hereunto subscribed my name and affixed the corporate seals of the said Companies,
this 25tk dayof June , 2019 |

SN
"P
113
L <
“‘“““
s“l’f
i \i
%

Michael C. Fay, Vice President

TO REPORT A CLAIM WITH REGARD TO A SURETY BOND, PLEASE SUBMIT A COMPLETE DESCRIPTION
OF THE CLAIM INCLUDING THE PRINCIPAL ON THE BOND, THE BOND NUMBER, AND YOUR CONTACT
INFORMATION TO:

Zurich Surety Claims

1299 Zurich Way

Schaumburg, IL 60196-1056
www.reportsfclaims(@ zurichna.com
800-626-4577




This is to ertify, that

State of Ohin

Bepartment of Insurance
Uertificate of Authority

Tffectipe Bate: September 10, 1969
Fxpivatinn Bate: April 01, 2020

FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND, THE

is authorized in @hio to transact the business of insurance as defired in the follofing section(s) of the Ghio Refised ode:

Section 3929.01 (A)
Allied Lines

Boiler & Machinery
Burglary & Theft

Comumercial Auto - Liability

Commercial Auto - No Fault

Commercial Auto - Physical Damage

Credit

Earthquake
Fidelity

Financial Guaranty
Fire

Glass

Inland Marine

Multiple Peril - Commercial

Multiple Peril - Homeowners

Other Liability
Surety

This Tertificate of Authority is subiect to the lafos of the State of @hin.

Mike DeWine, Governor

NAIC No. 39306

Workers Compensation

Jillian Froment, Director



1HUTU FIRIUE - DUl DUy IVIING LGV VIS ~ AU VSH I fEY, 3y
Columbus,Ohio 43215 - o e
(614)644-2658 Jillian Froment - Director )

Fax(614)644-3256 P .
www.insurance.ohio.gov Certificate of Comphance

Issued 03/22/2019
Effective 04/02/2019
Expires 04/01/2020

I, Jillian Froment, hereby certify that I am the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supervision of
insurance business in said State and as such I hereby certify that

FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND, THE

of Illinois is duly organized under the laws of this State and is authorized to transact the business of insurance under
the following section(s) of the Ohio Revised Code:

Section 3929.01 (A)

Allied Lines Workers Compensation
Boiler & Machinery

Burglary & Theft

Commercial Auto - Liability

Commercial Auto - No Fault

Commercial Auto - Physical Damage

Credit

Earthquake

Fidelity

Financial Guaranty

Fire

Glass

Inland Marine

Multiple Peril - Commercial

Multiple Peril - Homeowners

Other Liability

Surety

FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND. THE certified in its annual statement to this Department
as of December 31,2018 that it has admitted assets in the amount of $349,290,478, liabilities in the amount of
$75,580,762, and surplus of at least $273,709,716.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto subscribed my name and caused my seal to be affixed at Columbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

Jillian Froment, Director



THE FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY

OF MARYLAND
1299 Zurich Way Schaumburg, IL 60196

Statement of Financial Condition
As Of December 31,2018

ASSETS
BOMAS 1.t ieeeeectc it ete s et e st e ea e b et e s st s e R ere e e A e ees e e e e e e vRe e e bee b e e AR e edE e R er e A ba R reaek e he s Re R RE O $§ 245,255,635
SEOCKS s1ueteiierieeiieesiee e re sttt e ee s r e e e as vere s srme S van e shT e s Ae Eme e Re e R LA e SRR e R e rRe b S bes e R s s A s e b TR A 22,855,569
Cash and Short Term INVESIIENLS. ... ...e.ovteerereevissierreivsessesistsrersasiassrssesterasessesssssssassnrsassssessnsesasesens 3,092,872
ReinSUIance RECOVEIADIE iuuviiriecseeireiiersreienmesinesesecsnssessiesiesssssiesssneetsssssssnarsssresessstesssnsssssstsssessanes 73,242,781
Federal Income Tax RECOVEIADIE. ......couviieiiiciminieimiseriesisssseasiesirainersssssrmasessesssnsssasiossas osssssesne 42,258
Other AcCOUNES RECEIVADIE ....ccviivreiriierresirinentrereisesersneiee s ssersssessssesseses sressescosssssesonsissssasansassrstasase 4,801,363
TOTAL ADMITTED ASSETS .evvcvovereeessrsseessmssiessesssssssssassssastesssssssassosssensssssasmsssossssamsssesmsisssns $ 349,290,278
LIABILITIES, SURPLUS AND OTHER FUNDS
Reserve for Taxes and EXPENSES......ccviiiiiiiiinimiiiiiisisises s i sssssssssssesssesmsssssssens 3 106,785
Ceded Reinsurance Premiums Payable ... ssesnisinen, 46,727,605
Remittances and Items UnNallocated .....ccvveviorirecronninesiismssmisnrermimmesesemnesasssseoneressmscsosss ssssiossss 125,000
Payable to parents, subs and affiliates.........ovvviii 28,621,373
Securities Lending Collateral Liability ..o 0
TOTAL LIABILITIES 1.t ev1oseeeeecrebemseesessssmsessessstasssssssstsssssssessnsetassstebrasssassessstiasssssesssssssssessssasssonns $ 75,580,762
Capital Stock, Pai UP ...covvevivnimminreemereresersesessmemsesemnmressmmesesrsesem i ssstsssesssarenss $ 5,000,000
SUPIUS 1ottt e ev st s s bbb bR s b e R e s 268,709,716
Surplus as regards POLCYROIAEIS. ......oveviviii e s 273,709,716
TOTAL .etrieriereraresissetseoressesssasssasssseasenssnssseesensestessssansassssssssssstesssiatsersressinstinsosiossiseniosesssrontesinss $ 349,290,478

Securities carried at $162,739,508 in the above statement are deposited with various states as required by law.

Securities carried on the basis prescribed by the National Association of Insurance Commissioners. On the basis of
market quotations for all bonds and stocks owned, the Company's total admitted assets at December 31, 2018 would
be $349,736,423 and surplus as regards policyholders $274,155,661.

I, DENNIS F. KERRIGAN, Corporate Secretary of the FIDELITY AND DEPOSIT COMPANY OF MARYLAND, do hereby
certify that the foregoing statement is a correct exhibit of the assets and liabilities of the said Company on the 31st
day of December, 2018,

/ - -

7 _ ] o _: Corpo;ate SecretaTy
State of Illinois
City of Schaumburg } 88:

Subscribed and sworn to, before me, a Notary Public of the State of Ilfinois, in the City of Schaumburg, @20"‘ day of M7arch, 2019.
A ) s

Notary_Pubiic

?f_-"'\——"_'bw._‘us' n S N, N - N W,
j} KATHERINE R SCHULTZ ]}
i Official Seal P
q? Notary Public - State of Hliinols I

% My Commission Explres Nov 16, 2019

g S B e e Y



LEGAL NOTICE NO. 19007SWOP4G

Sealed bids will be received by the City of Dayton OH, on behalf of the participating entities of
Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government (SWOP4G). Bids will be received at the City of
Dayton OH Division of Procurement, 5th floor, City Hall Building, 101 W. Third St., Dayton OH
45402 no later than 3:00 P.M. local (Dayton OH) time on June 25, 2019, at which time such bids
will be publicly opened for the following item:

ROCK SALT

A certified check on a solvent bank, drawn and made payable to the City of Dayton OH, or a bid
bond by a surety company licensed to do business in Ohio, in a sum not less than 5% of the total
amount of the bid based on estimated tonnage for all entities, as surety for the execution of the contract,
shall accompany each bid. The checks of all bidders will be returned upon the execution and
securing of the contract.

The successful bidder will be required to execute the contract and to provide a 100% performance
bond within ten (10) days after the award of the contract if so requested by the individual entities.
In case the bidder neglects to so execute the contract, the check or bond, accompanying the bid
shall be forfeited to the City of Dayton OH, not as a penalty, but as liquidated damages.

Detailed specifications, bid forms and instructions to vendors may be obtained in the City of
Dayton OH Division of Procurement.

Donita Jo Garner, CPPB

Senior Buyer

City of Dayton OH

101 W. Third St. Room 514

Dayton OH 45402

937-333-4030 or donita.garner'w davionohio.gov

THE CITY OF DAYTON OH DOES NOT DISCRIMINATE ON THE BASIS OF RACE,
COLOR, NATIONAL ORIGIN, SEX, RELIGION, AGE AND HANDICAPPED STATUS IN
EMPLOYMENT OR THE PROVISION OF SERVICES.

Publish:  June 04, 2019



INFORMATION TO VENDORS

The intent of this bid is to establish a firm price agreement for the purchase of rock salt for the
City of Dayton OH and the participating entities of the Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government
(SWOP4G). The Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government is interested in a contract from
August 1, 2019 through July 31, 2020

The City of Dayton OH’s Division of Procurement has agreed to advertise and solicit bids for the
joint purchase of rock salt to obtain the best possible price for all participants. The bid calls for
delivered prices for the salt from origin to the individual entities.

The quantities listed on the attached sheets are estimated quantities for each entity. Actual
deliveries may be more or less, as the entities require. The successful vendor must have the
minimum quantities specified available for each entity, and must deliver to each entity the quantity
called for during the contract period. NO MINIMUM QUANTIES OR RECEIVING DATES
SHALL BE SET BY THE BIDDER. This is a MORE OR LESS bid only. Delivery and
invoicing addresses for each entity are included this bid document.

Each entity will issue a purchase order or letter of intent committing their estimated portion of this
request for rock salt. These are estimates only and bid will be provided as a MORE OR LESS
with NO minimum purchase requirements.

All sealed bids must be delivered to the City of Dayton OH Division of Procurement no later than
time and dated specified in the bid request (3:00 P.M. local (Dayton OH) time on June 25, 2019).
No bid may be withdrawn after it has been deposited with the Purchasing Agent of the City of
Dayton OH after the due date and time has passed. Bid forms and specifications may be secured
at the City of Dayton OH, Division of Procurement office, 5t floor, City Hall Building, 101 W.
Third St., Dayton OH 45402 or by going to www.daytonohio.gov/bids.aspx or
WWw.swop4g.org.

All bids must be made on the forms provided and must be in conformity with this notice. Bids
shall be returned with notice, bid form and specifications intact. All bids containing quotes not
asked for or which are otherwise not in conformity with this notice, may be considered invalid and
may be rejected. The right to reject any and all bids is reserved by City of Dayton OH and/or
SWOP4G. Formalities may be waived at the option of the organization.

All bids will be opened and read publicly on the bid due date.

A certified check or bid bond on a solvent bank, drawn and made payable to the City of Dayton
OH, or a bid bond by a surety company licensed to do business in Ohio, in a sum not less than 5%
of the total amount of the bid based on estimated tonnage for all entities, as surety for the execution
of the contract, shall accompany each bid. The checks of all bidders will be returned upon the
execution of the contract.

Failure of vendor to furnish material complying with the specifications called for in this invitation
to bid, or to comply with the terms of this invitation, may be justification to purchase the materials
in the open market and/or to cancel the contract or applicable portions thereof, and award the
portions canceled to another supplier. In the event either of the above procedures must be resorted
to, the vendor shall be required to reimburse those participating entities for any expense incurred
in excess of the contract price.



1.

GENERAL CONDITIONS

The City of Dayton OH and SWOP4G reserves the right to reject any or all bids, to waive any
irregularities in a bid, or to accept the bid or bids which in the judgment of proper officials, is
to the best interest of the City. The City reserves the right to accept a part or parts of a bid
unless otherwise restricted in the bid. We are not permitted to accept telephone bids or Fax
bids. In case of error in extending the total amount of the bid the unit prices the will govern.

. Title and risk of loss to and with respect to the items shall remain in the Vendor until the items

in a completed state have been delivered to and accepted by the City of Dayton or to an agent
or consignee duly designated by the City of Dayton at the location specified on the face hereof,
items which are to be shipped shall be shipped F.O.B. destination unless otherwise specified by
the City of Dayton. A packing slip must accompany each such shipment and if a shipment is to
a consignee or an agent of the City of Dayton, a copy of the packing slip shall be forwarded
concurrently to the City of Dayton. If no such packing slip is sent, the count or weight by the
City of Dayton or its agent or consignee is agreed to be final and binding on the Vendor with
respect to such shipment.

In case of default by the bidder or contractor, the City of Dayton OH and/or SWOPA4G entities
may procure the articles or services from other sources and hold the bidder or contractor
responsible for any excess cost occasioned thereby.

Prices should be stated in units of quantity specified.

Prices quoted unless otherwise stated by bidder, will be considered as being based on delivery
to destination as designated and to include any charges for packing, crating, containers, etc.
and being in strict accordance with specifications as shown.

Wherever a reference is made in the specification or in describing the material, supplies or
services required, of a particular trade name, manufacturers' catalog or model number, the
bidder, if awarded a contract will be required to furnish the particular item referred to in strict
accordance with the specifications or description unless a departure or substitution is clearly
noted and described in the bid by the bidder.

The bidder, if awarded an order or contract, agrees to protect, defend and save harmless the
City and/or SWOP4G entities against any demand for payment for use of any patented
material, process, article or device, that may enter into the manufacture, construction, or form
a part of the work covered by either order or contract; and he further agrees to indemnify and
save harmless the City and/or SWOP4G entities from suits or actions of every nature and
description brought against it for, or on account of any injuries or damages received or
sustained by any party or parties, by or from any of the acts of the contractor, his servants, or
agents.

Samples, if requested, must be furnished free of expense prior to the opening of bids and, if
not destroyed, will, upon request, be returned at the bidder's expense.



INSTRUCTIONS TO BIDDERS

. Each bid shall be signed by a duly authorized representative that can bind said company. Bids
by partnerships must be signed with the partnership name by one of the members of the
partnership, or by an authorized representative, followed by the signature and title of the person
signing. Bids by corporations must be signed with the name of the corporation, followed by
the signature of a person authorized to bind it in this matter.

. Bids, to receive consideration, must be received prior to the specified time/date of closing as
designated in the bid document.

. Sealed envelopes, with bid number and bidder name, must be submitted.

. If multiple bids are submitted each bid shall be submitted in its own sealed envelope as
indicated above (Item #3).

. Bids having any erasures or corrections shall include explanation with signature of authorized
representative. Any non-explained erasures or corrections may be result in bid being rejected.

. Bidders may submit bids on any one or group of items, provided, however, that the unit price
is shown as requested.

. References in the specification or in describing the material, supplies or services required, of
a particular trade name, manufacturers' catalog or model number are made for descriptive
purposes to guide the bidder in interpreting the type of material or supplies or nature of the
work desired.

General Conditions, paragraph six (6), shall be strictly adhered to, no exception can be taken.

. Bids should be mailed or delivered to the City of Dayton OH Division of Procurement, 5%
floor, City Hall Building, 101 W. Third St., Dayton OH 45402.
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SOUTHWEST OHIO PURCHASERS FOR GOVERNMENT (SWOP4G)
ROCK SALT
GENERAL SPECIFICATIONS
SCOPE

For furnishing during the period of the contract, the commodity listed herein, as required
by participating entities and divisions from time to time.

PRICE AGREEMENT

Bid price shall remain firm during the term of the contract.

PERFORMANCE BOND

Each individual entity may, at its option, require a 100% performance bond for the total
tonnage required by that entity. The cost of the performance bond will be added to the
price of the salt, and will be considered in the award determination. The cost of the
performance bond must be listed on the proposal page.

DELIVERY

The material shall be delivered as required to the participating entities at the addresses
listed on the attached listing of delivery and invoicing addresses.

A blanket purchase order or letter of intent will be issued by each entity. Releases will be
made off these blanket purchase orders or letters as required.

Vendor will be required to start delivery to storage facility within 48 hours of initial order
and have entire order delivered within 96 hours. Delivery must be made between the hours
of 8:00 a.m. and 3:30 p.m., Monday through Friday. Delivery at other times will be allowed
only with prior approval of the authorizing entity.

Delivery shall be sent directly to each entity. Delivery addresses are on the attached listing.
Note: Delivery addresses may be subject to change by individual entity.

CONTRACT PERIOD

The Southwest Ohio Purchasers for Government is interested in a contract from August 1,
2019 through July 31, 2020.

INVOICING
Invoices shall be sent directly to each entity. Invoicing addresses are on the attached

listing. Note: Invoicing addresses may be subject to change by individual entity if so
needed.
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AWARD
Prices should be bid in the units requested. The City of Dayton OH and SWOP4G reserve
the right to reject any or all bids. A representative of SWOP4G reserves the right to

determine what is or is not in the best interests of the entities.

AWARDING CRITERIA

In making an award, each participating entity will evaluate the bids received and will issue
its own purchase order or letter of intent based upon the lowest and best bid to that entity.
Consideration will also be given to the factors listed below, as well as other factors, which
are considered pertinent.

1) Past experience of municipalities with the vendors.
2) Total delivered net price.

3) Delivery time.

4) Compliance with specifications.

5 Salt availability and stockpile capacity.

6) Domestic salt vs. Off-shore salt

BIDDER QUALIFICATIONS

Bidder must include with the bid a statement detailing how long the company has been in
the business of supplying highway rock salt to public entities. References may be required
during the evaluation process. Bidders may be requested to provide a listing of public
accounts where a minimum of 1,000 Tons of highway rock salt was delivered.

REQUIREMENTS AND DATA

Estimates are for a twelve (12) month period and are on a "more or less'" basis. Actual
orders may be more or less than estimated. Estimates indicated will be used solely for the
purpose of making a tabulation of bids.

Domestic salt is preferred. If foreign salt is to be supplied by the vendor, it must be clearly
identified in the bid document, and will be taken into consideration when evaluating bids.

All foreign salt shall meet the same requirements as that of domestic salt.

Bids will be accepted for delivery to individual entities only. Bids will not be accepted for
a total tonnage to be supplied to the entire organization.

DEFAULT STATUS

Any entity that has placed a vendor in default with the entity will not be required to place
an order with that vendor until the default status has been lifted.

ADDITIONAL PARTICIPATION

Other SWOP4G entities may wish to participate in this bid. Please indicate, in the area
designated on pricing page, if this additional participation will be permitted.
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SUBMISSION OF BIDS

All bids must be received in the City of Dayton OH Division of Procurement no later than
3:00 P.M. local (Dayton OH) time, on June 25, 2019. Envelopes must be clearly marked,
“Rock Salt, Bid No. 19007SWOP4G". Bidders should take caution if U.S. Mails or other
carriers are to be used for submission of bids. Mailing should be made in sufficient time
for bids to arrive at the City’s Division of Procurement no later than the time and date
specified above.

CONTACT PERSON(S)

Please provide name,-telephone number and email address of contact person for bid and
for order(s) in the area designated on pricing page.

**15.0 AFLCMC/PZIO. Wright Patterson AFB. Ohio (Entity No. 82)

16.0

Wright-Patterson AFB (WPAFB) is not subject to any SWOP4G bylaws, specifications,
rules, regulations or state law associated with the procurement salt. Wright-Patterson AFB
(WPAFB) is submitting its proposed salt needs for informational purposes only and is not
obligated to purchase any salt. Should WPAFB determine that it intends to purchase salt,
it may do so with no obligation to use the bid pricing submitted to the SWOP4G. Any
purchase made by WPAFB is governed exclusive by Federal laws and regulations to
include, but not limited to, the Federal Acquisition Regulation and its supplements.

WPAFB's purchase of salt is subject to the provisions of the Anti-Deficiency Act, 31
U.S.C. 1341. WPAFB's inclusion of its salt needs shall not be interpreted to require
WPAFB to commit, obligate, appropriate or spend funds or support in violation of the Anti-
Deficiency Act and other applicable laws respecting federal funding. WPAFB's
participation with the SWOP4G is strictly subject to budget limitations and availability of
funds.

Invoicing for WPAFB purchases shall be accomplished through the Wide Area Work Flow
system as prescribed in DFARS 252.232-7006 WIDE AREA WORKFLOW PAYMENT
INSTRUCTIONS (MAY 2013).

All WPAFB deliveries shall be made by a Conveyor Truck.

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

Additional information concerning this bid package may be obtained by contacting
Donita Jo Garner, CPPB, City of Dayton OH, 937-333-4030, or by e-mail at
donita.garner @ davtonohio.gov.

Vendor may have to register to do business with each governmental agency as may be
required.



TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS
SECTION A: SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT)

All trucks and stockpiles other than mine location, shall be adequately covered to assure that the sodium
chloride will be delivered in a free flowing, usable condition.

Bidders shall list below the location of all mines from which rock salt will be taken to fulfill this contract:

Detroit. Mi

Bidder shall also list below the working capacity of each stockpile to be used:

Toledo, OH, ~80,000

Dayton, OH, ~80,000

The City of Dayton OH and participating entities reserve the right to spot check truck and/or trailer loads at point
of delivery, for weight confirmation to that shown on weight slip or invoice (including tare weight if deemed
advisable). Upon direction by authorized personnel, truck shall proceed to the nearest independent scale for such
weight determination.

Salt containing free water, foreign matter, or lumps will be rejected at point of delivery. Salt must be "Free-
Flowing," be in such graduation to be blown, and shall meet Ohio State Highway Department Specifications,
Section 712.03. Sufficient non-caking additive shall be incorporated in the delivered material in order to prevent
caking under normal outdoor storage conditions.

Where there is evidence of moisture in excess of 2.00%, a composite sample of salt shall be taken from the truck
and tested for moisture content.



Sodium Chloride shall be of fresh stock. Reclaimed salt will not be accepted. Grade shall be "Course Crystal"
as required. Screening shall conform to the following size requirements:

U.S. Screen Size "CC" Scale
3/8" % Passing 100

#4 % Passing 70 Max
#8 % Passing 20 Max.
#12 % Passing 5 Max.

Tests of rock salt delivered under the contract may be made from time to time and any which does not conform
to the specifications will be returned to the contractor at his expense. If the vendor cannot supply salt meeting
these specifications in a reasonable period of time, the entity will purchase the salt elsewhere on the open market
and charge the vendor in non-compliance for the difference in price.

Salt shall be delivered as needed in motor transport loads. All salt deliveries shall be made as agreed upon by
each entity with the successful vendor. Salt shall not be unloaded on the ground or outside of a salt shed without
specific permission. Twenty-four (24) hour notice of delivery must be made to dispatcher or contact person at
telephone number listed on attached listing.

All deliveries of sodium chloride shall include:

1) Adequate equipment to stock salt, such as conveyor, blower, piler, slinger, etc., as needed for the particular
installations utilized at the delivery destination.

2) If the type of unloader or the maximum height to be unloaded is unknown it will be the responsibility of
the vendor to contact those participating for the information.

A deduction equal to that assessed when unloading equipment is used will be deducted from invoice when said
equipment is requested by the entity, but not used in the placement of sodium chloride.

Vendors will be responsible for any damage caused to equipment due to foreign materials in the salt. Vendors

will also be responsible for any damage to salt storage building resulting from the improper piling of salt, and or
caked salt (including equipment and labor costs).
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BID NO. 19007SWOP4G FORM

Company Name: Detroit Salt Company, LLC

Address: 12841 Sanders St.

City State & Zip Code: Detroit, Ml 48217

Telephone No. 313.841.5144 Fax No. -313.841.1102

Contact Person for Bid: Name; Jean Szatkowski Phone No.: 313.841.5144

Email Address: sales@detroitsalt.com

Contact Person for Orders: Name: Gabrielle Hopkins B Phone No.: 313.841.5144
Email Address: orders@detroitsalt.com

How long the company has been in the business of supplying rock salt to public entities 20  years
Details

Federal Identification Number (or SSN if sole proprietorship): 38-3341484 -
- £y ‘W B

SIGNATURE: Lol S

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE: ‘Richelle Labut, Business Operations Manager

By signing this page, you state that you are an authorized representative, and have reviewed and are presenting this proposal on behalf
of your business entity. Please continue completing this exhibit on the next page.

Additional Participation:
Other SWOP4G entities may wish to participate in this bid. Please indicate if this participation will be permitted.

Yes No x If "ves", SWOP4G must review and give approval to additional governmental agencies.
Piling Charge per Ton (all locations) $ $6.50/ton f\priI-October $8.50/ton November-March
Performance Bond: Cost per $1,000 $ 10.00 / per $1,000

Terms: NET 30 Date:  06/24/19




BID PRICING PAGES

Please provide a delivered price for the salt from origin to the INDIVIDUAL ENTITIES.
FREIGHT IS TO BE INCLUDED. Also list the stockpile and mine to be used for each location.

Bidders are to submit one (1) original copy signed by an officer authorized to bind the company, Excel spreadsheet and
one (1) electronic flash drive of signed bid and Excel spreadsheet.

ESTIMATED Price/Ton

Organization Total Tons  Rock Salt Stockpile/Mine Location
1. Batavia Township 600 S_No Bid
2. Bath Township 700 S No Bid
3. Beavercreek Township 1,200 $_No Bid
4. Beavercreek, City of 8,000 $ No Bid
5. Bellbrook, City of 700 $ No Bid
6. Blendon Township 300 $ No Bid
7. Brookville, City of 500 s 87.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit
8. Butler Township 2,000 S 87.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit
9. Cardington, Village of 100 ¢ No Bid
10. Cedarville, Village of 275 ¢ No Bid
11. Central Ohio Transit 400 $ No Bid
Authority (COTA)
12. Clearcreek Township 1,800 ¢ No Bid
5 ClmonComy LLL
14. Clinton Township 300 ¢ No Bid
15. Concord Township 900 ¢ No Bid
16. Dayton City Schools 100 $ 8487 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit
17. Dayton, City of 10,000 $ 90.37 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit
18. Dublin, City of 2,000 ¢ No Bid
19, Englewood, City of 1,200 § 85.87 Dayton/Toledo/Detroit
20. Evendale, Village of 700 ¢ No Bid
21. Farmersville, Village of 150 ¢ No Bid
22. Gahanna, City of 3,000 $ No Bid .
23. Genoa Township 600 $ No Bid
Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company, LLC



24.
25.

26.
27.
28.

29.
30.

31.
32.

33.

34.
35.
36.

37.

38.
39.
40.
41.

42.
43.

44,
45.
46.
47.
48.

Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company, LLC

Organization

Germantown, City of

Gilead Township
(Morrow County)

Glendale, Village of
Goshen Township
Grandview Heights, City of

Greater Dayton RTA

Greene County Engineer

Hamilton, City of

Harlem Township
Harrison Township,

Hilliard, City of
Indian Hill, Village of
Jackson Township

Jefferson Township

Kettering, City of
Mad River Local Schools
Mason, City of

Miami County Engineers
Office

Miami Township
(Clermont County)

Miami Township
(Montgomery County)

Miamisburg, City of
Middletown, City of
Milford, City of
Monroe, City of

Montgomery County
Engineer

ESTIMATED Price/Ton Rock

Total Tons

300

100

300
600
750
200
7,500
4,000
250
1,000
2,000
2,500
150
300
4,800

120
5,000

5,000

2,700

3,500

3,500
4,500
700
3,000

10,000

13

Salt

$ 89.15
$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$ No Bid
¢ No Bid

$ 84.87
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
¢ 90.37
¢ No Bid
¢ No Bid
$ 84.87

¢ 90.37

$ No Bid

$ 85.87
¢ No Bid
$ No Bid

$ No Bid

$ 92.70

$ 89.15
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
¢ No Bid
$ 84.87

Stockpile/Mine Location

_Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit




49.

50.
51
52.
53.
54.
55.
56.
57.
58.
59.
60.
61.
62.
63.
64.
65.

66.
67.
68.

69.
70.
71.
72.

73.
74.

75.

Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company, LLC

Orgcanization

Montgomery County Parks

Moraine, City of
Mount Gilead, Village
New Albany, City of
New Carlisle, City of
New Jasper Township
Ozkwood, City of
Obetz, Village of
Pierce Township
Piqua, City of

Powell, City of
Riverside, City of
Sharonville, City of
St. Bernard, Village of
Stonelick Township
Sugarcreek Township

Tate Township
(Clermont County)
Trenton, City of

Trotwood, City of

Union Township Trustees

Union, City of
Vandalia, City of
Washington Township

Washington Township
{Clermont County)

West Carrollton, City of
West Jefferson, Village of

West Milton, Municipality
of

ESTIMATED Price/Ton Rock

Total Tons

100

1,500
100
500
300
400
800
400

1,000

2,000

1,000

1,400

1,200
600
350

1,000
200

600
1,500
1,200

600
2,000
2,000

100

1,000
500

300

14

Salt

§ 90.37

$ 85.87

Stockpile/Mine Location

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

$ No Bid
¢ No Bid
¢ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ 85.87

$ No Bid
§ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
§ 85.87

$ No Bid
¢ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ No Bid
$ 90.98

$ No Bid

§ 85.87

¢ 85.87

¢ 89.15

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

$ No Bid

¢ 89.15

Dayton/Toledo/Detroit

$ No Bid

$ No Bid




ESTIMATED Price/Ton Rock

Organization “Total Tons  Salt Stockpile/Mine Location
76. Whitehall, City of 5,000 $ No Bid
77. Williamsburg Township 150 $ No Bid
78. Worthington, City of 1,500 ¢ No Bid
79. Xenia, City of 1,500 ¢ NoBid
80. Xenia Township Board of No Bid
Trustees 600 S
81. Village of Yellow Springs 320 s No Bid
82. Wright-Patterson AFB 2,100 $ No Bid

Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company, LLC
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CITY OF DAYTON
ROCK SALT
Bid No. 19007SWOP4G

Name of Bidding Company: Detroit Salt Company, LLC

Please provide the company name, address, contact person, telephone number and email address of three (3) references previously
serviced by your Company that will be able to speak to you material quality and customer service standards for the materials
described in Bid 19007SWOP4G.

Company Name: ~ State of Michigan, Department of Management and Budget

Address: 525 W. Allegan Street, Lansing, Ml 48909 B
Contact Person: Dan Stevens

Telephone Number: 517.989.14%9 Fax Number:

Email Address: StevensD6@Michigan.gov I

State of Illinois, Central Management
Company Name:

401 S. Spring Street, Springfield, IL 62706

Address: B DR

Contact Person: Wayne lisley

Telephone Number: ~ 217-782-8091 Fax Number:

Email Address: B

Company Name: City of Chicago, Department of Sireets

Address: 121 N. LaSalle, Chicago, IL 60602

Contact Person: John Bieg

Telephone Number: 19 7AA_GAAG Fax Number: - -

Email Address:

16



Business Income Tax Questionnaire

Thefollowinginformation is required to determine yourCity of Dayton, Ohioincome tax liability, ifany, andto setupyouraccountifrequired.

Type of Tax Filing: {check all that apply)

1.7 Employee Withholding FEIN #
2.[X] Corporate Earnings FEIN # 38-334-1484
3.[individual Ownership Earnings SSN #
4[] Partnership Earnings FEIN #
Company Name__Detroit Salt Company, LLC Phone # 313.841.5144
Mailing Address__12841 Sanders St City Detroit st Ml zjp 48217
Local Business Address__same City St Zip

Check the jurisdictions that we administer that you aperate in:
[x] Dayton City Limits[_] Dayton Wright Brothers Airport | Dayton International Airport || NONE

Date Business Started in Our Taxing Jurisdiction

Your Accounting Period? Calendar Year or Fiscal Year ending on _September 30

Withholding Information *Quarterly Withholding cannot exceed $600.00

Do you have employees? Yes [ orNo K1 Date First Employee Started Working in Our Jurisdiction
Do you submit withholdings QUARTERLY* or MONTHLY?

Is this a courtesy withholding for your employees who are residents of the above cities only? Yes [ orNo L

Do you rent or sublease property or space in the Dayton jurisdiction to another business or individual? Yes LI no [
If so list Names, Addresses, and Tax ID below. If Yes, do they have employees working at that location? Yes ] no (]

Do you use Subcontractors? Yes No L1 if so list Names, Addresses, and FEIN or Social Security Numbers below.
BSM, 13748 Shady Lane, Monroe, Ml 48161 FEIN: 46-2881109

if you have filed returns with our office before, show Name and Tax ID #s used, and for what tax years you filed.

Full name of Owner of Company __Kissner USA, Inc, 10955 Lowell Ave, Overland Park, KS 66210

If this is a change of ownership, please provide the date of change, the name, address, and phone number of former owner

If you are not liable to pay taxes in our jurisdiction, please explain why.
The Detroit Salt Com_pany is a single member LLC and a disregarded entity for federal incon]e tax purposes. ltis inclu_ded ina

reurn i ayon s it doefrfel. pupe. »
Signature Title Business Operations Manger nate  06/24/19

Thank you for your cooperation in this request. For more tax information is available at www.datonohio gov

Please return by MAIL or by FAX to: City of Dayton, Division of Revenue & Taxation, 101 West 3rd Street, P.O. Box 2808, Dayton, Chio 45401
(937) 333-3500 ~ Fax (937) 333-4280
CS-25¢
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