
ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB
SEASON 2024-2025 

Low Bid
Delivered price
Pick-up price

Item  
No. Organization Estimated  Total

 Tons  more or l
ess

American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt
Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price

1 Batavia Township 700 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06) $85.06 $84.07 $81.00 $84.09 $80.00

2 Bath Township 300 $81.42 $75.00 $63.57) $61.57 $82.54 $81.00 $83.47 $80.00

3 Beavercreek Township 1,000 $84.91 $75.00 $62.63) $60.63 $86.16 $81.00 $86.19 $80.00

4 Beavercreek, City of 3,000 $84.91 $75.00 $61.60) $59.60 $86.16 $81.00 $86.19 $80.00

5 Bellbrook, City of 400 $84.91 $75.00 $62.34) $60.34 $86.89 $81.00 $85.01 $80.00

6 Bexley, City of 100 $71.11 $75.00 $61.54) $59.54 $71.98 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

7 Blendon Township 500 $71.30 $75.00 $61.35) $59.35 $71.81 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

8 Blue Ash, City of 2,500 $92.76 $75.00 $86.27) $84.27 $84.23 $81.00 $86.21 $80.00

9 Brookville, City of 300 $86.38 $75.00 $65.11) $63.11 $82.88 $81.00 $80.31 $80.00

10 Butler Township ( 1,500)             $84.91 $75.00 $64.63) $62.63 $83.28 $81.00 $84.23 $80.00

11 Caesarscreek Township 300 $73.92 $75.00 $61.88) $59.88 $81.43 $81.00 NO BID NO BID

12 Cardington, Village of 75 $72.42 $75.00 $59.89) $57.89 $68.64 $68.00 $69.44 $70.00

13 Cedarville, Village of 200 $79.81 $75.00 $60.81) $58.81 $81.33 $81.00 $83.14 $80.00

14 Central Ohio Transit Authority 600 $71.11 $75.00 $61.07) $59.07 $72.01 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

15 Clayton, City of 700 NO BID NO BID $65.19) $63.19 $82.55 $81.00 $83.83 $80.00

16 Clermont County Engineer’s Office 1,500 NO BID NO BID $87.27) $85.27 $84.24 $81.00 $84.26 $80.00

17 Clinton Township 100 $71.17 $75.00 $61.07) $59.07 $72.34 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

18 Concord Township 750 $72.73 $75.00 $60.35) $58.35 $69.14 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

19 Dayton Public Schools 150 $83.09 $75.00 $65.21) $63.21 $82.89 $81.00 $83.83 $80.00

20 Dayton, City of 4,000 $86.38 $75.00 $63.40) $61.40 $82.99 $81.00 $83.93 $80.00

21 Dublin, City of 2,000 NO BID NO BID $61.38) $59.38 $70.09 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

22 Englewood, City of 1,200 $84.91 $75.00 $64.98) $62.98 $81.42 $81.00 $85.09 $80.00

23 Evendale, Village of 400 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96) $82.96 $85.39 $81.00 $87.39 $80.00

24 Fairborn, City of 1,600 $81.42 $75.00 $63.38) $61.38 $82.57 $81.00 $83.51 $80.00

25 Farmersville, Village of 50 $87.83 $75.00 $65.27) $63.27 $83.28 $81.00 $83.31 $80.00

26 Gahanna, City of 2,800 $71.98 $75.00 $61.44) $59.44 $71.26 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

27 Genoa Township 400 $71.85 $75.00 $60.69) $58.69 $71.20 $68.00 $71.22 $70.00

28 Germantown, City of 400 $92.49 $75.00 $65.17) $63.17 $84.19 $81.00 $84.22 $80.00

29 German Township 250 $87.83 $75.00 $64.79) $62.79 $82.83 $81.00 $83.77 $80.00

30 Gilead Township 200 $79.81 $75.00 $60.22) $58.22 $67.92 $68.00 $68.72 $70.00

31 Glendale, Village of 300 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96) $82.96 $86.25 $81.00 $88.27 $80.00

32 Goshen Township 600 $88.05 $75.00 $87.69) $85.69 $87.98 $81.00 $90.05 $80.00

33 Grandview Heights, City of 500 $71.17 $75.00 $60.74) $58.74 $71.57 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

34 Greene County Engineer 7,500 $83.09 $75.00 $62.07) $60.07 $82.57 $81.00 $83.51 $80.00

35 Hamilton, City of 3,000 $92.76 $75.00 $66.84) $64.84 $83.97 $81.00 $85.94 $80.00

36 Harlem Township 300 $72.35 $75.00 $60.25) $58.25 $70.28 $68.00 $71.87 $70.00

37 Harrison Township 1,000 $84.00 $75.00 $64.45) $62.45 $82.63 $81.00 $83.56 $80.00

38 Hilliard, City of 1,500 $72.30 $75.00 $60.87) $58.87 $72.39 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

39 Huber Heights, City of 3,000 $81.42 $75.00 $64.30) $62.30 $83.35 $81.00 $84.29 $80.00

40 Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 $92.76 $75.00 $67.59) $65.59 $84.23 $81.00 $86.21 $80.00

41 Jackson Township 100 $87.83 $75.00 $64.92) $62.92 $82.58 $81.00 $83.52 $80.00

42 Jamestown, Village of 60 $81.42 $75.00 $63.51) $61.51 $82.55 $81.00 $84.39 $80.00

43 Jefferson Township 400 $83.09 $75.00 $65.44) $63.44 $82.66 $81.00 $83.59 $80.00

44 Kettering, City of 5,500 NO BID NO BID $63.66) $61.66 $83.17 $81.00 $84.12 $80.00

45 Mad River Local Schools 50 $83.09 $75.00 $65.55) $63.55 $83.10 $81.00 $84.04 $80.00

46 Mason, City of 5,500 $88.05 $75.00 $63.15) $61.15 $85.42 $81.00 $87.43 $80.00

47 Miami County Engineers Office 6,000 $86.38 $75.00 $62.68) $60.68 $74.34 $67.00 NO BID NO BID

48 Miami Township (Clermont County) 1,500 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06) $85.06 $84.23 $81.00 $86.21 $80.00

49 Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,000 $87.83 $75.00 $64.65) $62.65 $82.98 $81.00 $83.01 $80.00

50 Miamisburg, City of 3,000 $87.83 $75.00 $63.00) $61.00 $83.36 $81.00 $83.38 $80.00

51 Middletown, City of 3,500 $92.76 $75.00 $69.34) $67.34 $86.26 $81.00 $88.29 $80.00

52 Milford, City of 750 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06) $85.06 $86.81 $81.00 $88.85 $80.00



ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB
SEASON 2024-2025 

Low Bid
Delivered price
Pick-up price

Item  
No. Organization Estimated  Total

 Tons  more or l
ess

American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt
Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price

53 Monroe, City of 3,000 $88.05 $75.00 $87.21) $85.21 $87.12 $81.00 $89.17 $80.00

54 Montgomery County Engineer's Office 10,000 $86.37 $75.00 $64.34) $62.34 $82.59 $81.00 $83.53 $80.00

55 Montgomery County Parks 150 $86.38 $75.00 $64.84) $62.84 $82.97 $81.00 $83.00 $80.00

56 Moraine, City of ( 1,500)             $86.38 $75.00 $63.70) $61.70 $82.43 $81.00 $83.36 $80.00

57 Mt. Gilead, Village of ( 100)                $71.42 $75.00 $59.90) $57.90 $67.92 $68.00 $68.72 $70.00

58 New Carlisle, City of 300 $77.07 $75.00 $61.56) $59.56 $83.26 $81.00 NO BID NO BID

59 New Jasper Township 400 $81.42 $75.00 $63.60) $61.60 $82.55 $81.00 $83.48 $80.00

60 Oakwood, City of 900 $86.38 $75.00 $63.97) $61.97 $83.35 $81.00 $83.37 $80.00

61 Obetz, City of 300 $71.30 $75.00 $66.45) $64.45 $72.49 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

62 Perry Township (Franklin County) 400 $71.35 $75.00 $60.93) $58.93 $72.36 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

63 Pierce Township 1,000 $94.31 $75.00 $86.26) $84.26 $85.52 $81.00 $87.53 $80.00

64 Piqua, City of 2,500 $87.83 $75.00 $64.48) $62.48 $73.70 $67.00 NO BID NO BID

65 Powell, City of 1,500 $70.85 $75.00 $60.71) $58.71 $70.61 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

66 Riverside, City of 3,000 $83.09 $75.00 $64.32) $62.32 $82.55 $81.00 $83.48 $80.00

67 Sharonville, City of 1,500 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96) $82.96 $84.53 $81.00 $81.73 $80.00

68 Sidney, City of 1,200 $92.76 $75.00 $62.98) $60.98 $74.73 $67.00 NO BID NO BID

69 St. Bernard, Village of 600 $92.76 $75.00 $84.96) $82.96 $81.82 $81.00 $81.84 $80.00

70 Stonelick Township Board of Trustees 50 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06) $85.06 $84.07 $81.00 $84.09 $80.00

71 Sugarcreek Township 1,500 $77.60 $75.00 $62.53) $60.53 $81.17 $81.00 $78.65 $80.00

72 Tate Township (Clermont County OH) 150 $92.76 $75.00 $87.69) $85.69 $85.20 $81.00 $85.22 $80.00

73 Trenton, City of 500 $92.76 $75.00 $87.06) $85.06 $88.43 $81.00 $90.51 $80.00

74 Trotwood, City of 2,000 $86.38 $75.00 $64.12) $62.12 $83.06 $81.00 $84.01 $80.00

75 Troy, City of 500 $86.36 $75.00 $62.12) $60.12 $76.05 $67.00 $80.39 $80.00

76 Union Township Trustees 2,400 $92.76 $75.00 $85.38) $83.38 $81.58 $81.00 $79.84 $80.00

77 Union, City of 600 $84.91 $75.00 $65.20) $63.20 $81.65 $81.00 NO BID NO BID

78 Upper Arlington, City of ( 1,000)             NO BID NO BID $61.53) $59.53 $70.79 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

79 Vandalia, City of 2,000 $83.09 $75.00 $64.66) $62.66 $81.38 $81.00 NO BID NO BID

80 Washington Township (Montgomery County OH) 2,500 $86.38 $75.00 $64.04) $62.04 $83.28 $81.00 $84.23 $80.00

81 Washington Township (Clermont County) 40 $97.26 $75.00 $87.69) $85.69 $84.24 $81.00 $84.26 $80.00

82 West Carrollton, City of 1,200 $86.38 $75.00 $63.94) $61.94 $83.12 $81.00 $83.15 $80.00

83 West Jefferson, Village of 400 $72.85 $75.00 $62.29) $60.29 $73.16 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

84 West Milton, Municipality of 325 $86.38 $75.00 $65.09) $63.09 $77.78 $67.00 NO BID NO BID

85 Whitehall, City of 3,000 $71.67 $75.00 $61.51) $59.51 $71.13 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

86 Williamsburg Township 120 $92.76 $75.00 $88.92) $86.92 $85.20 $81.00 $85.22 $80.00

87 Woodlawn OH, Village of 600 $92.76 $75.00 $65.44) $63.44 $85.39 $81.00 $87.39 $80.00

88 Worthington, City of 2,000 $71.30 $75.00 $61.51) $59.51 $70.01 $68.00 NO BID NO BID

89 Wright-Patterson AFB                            
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications

2,100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $86.99 $80.00

90 Xenia, City of 1,500 $83.09 $75.00 $62.01) $60.01 $85.33 $81.00 $85.36 $80.00

91 Xenia Township 800 $81.42 $75.00 $63.23) $61.23 $82.69 $81.00 $83.54 $80.00

92 Yellow Springs, Village of 300 $81.42 $75.00 NO BID NO BID $83.50 $81.00 NO BID NO BID



ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB
SEASON 2025-2026 

Low Bid
Delivered price
Pick-up price

Item  
No. Organization Estimated  Total

 Tons  more or l
ess

American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt
Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price

1 Batavia Township 700 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06) $95.06) $91.07 $88.00 $86.62 $82.00

2 Bath Township 300 $85.49 $78.00 $73.57) $71.57) $89.54 $88.00 $85.98 $82.00

3 Beavercreek Township 1,100 $89.16 $78.00 $72.63) $70.63) $93.16 $88.00 $88.77 $82.00

4 Beavercreek, City of 3,000 $89.16 $78.00 $71.60) $69.60) $93.16 $88.00 $88.77 $82.00

5 Bellbrook, City of 400 $89.16 $78.00 $72.34) $70.34) $93.89 $88.00 $87.56 $82.00

6 Bexley, City of 100 $74.66 $78.00 $71.54) $69.54) $78.98 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

7 Blendon Township 500 $74.86 $78.00 $71.35) $69.35) $78.81 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

8 Blue Ash, City of 2,500 $97.39 $78.00 $96.27) $94.27) $91.23 $88.00 $88.80 $82.00

9 Brookville, City of 300 $90.69 $78.00 $75.11) $73.11) $89.88 $88.00 $82.72 $82.00

10 Butler Township ( 1,500)             $89.16 $78.00 $74.63) $72.63) $90.28 $88.00 $86.72 $82.00

11 Caesarscreek Township 300 $77.61 $78.00 $71.88) $69.88) $88.43 $88.00 NO BID NO BID

12 Cardington, Village of 75 $76.04 $78.00 $69.89) $67.89) $75.64 $75.00 $71.52 $72.00

13 Cedarville, Village of 200 $83.80 $78.00 $70.81) $68.81) $88.33 $88.00 $85.64 $82.00

14 Central Ohio Transit Authority 600 $74.66 $78.00 $71.07) $69.07) $79.01 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

15 Clayton, City of 700 NO BID NO BID $75.19) $73.19) $89.55 $88.00 $86.35 $82.00

16 Clermont County Engineer’s Office 1,500 NO BID NO BID $97.27) $95.27) $91.24 $88.00 $86.79 $82.00

17 Clinton Township 200 $74.73 $78.00 $71.07) $69.07) $79.34 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

18 Concord Township 750 $76.37 $78.00 $70.35) $68.35) $76.14 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

19 Dayton Public Schools 150 $87.24 $78.00 $75.21) $73.21) $89.89 $88.00 $86.35 $82.00

20 Dayton, City of 4,000 $90.69 $78.00 $73.40) $71.40) $89.99 $88.00 $86.45 $82.00

21 Dublin, City of 2,000 NO BID NO BID $71.38) $69.38) $77.09 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

22 Englewood, City of 1,200 $89.16 $78.00 $74.98) $72.98) $88.42 $88.00 $87.64 $82.00

23 Evendale, Village of 400 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96) $92.96) $92.39 $88.00 $90.01 $82.00

24 Fairborn, City of will re-evaluate $85.49 $78.00 $73.38) $71.38) $89.57 $88.00 $86.01 $82.00

25 Farmersville, Village of 50 $92.22 $78.00 $75.27) $73.27) $90.28 $88.00 $85.81 $82.00

26 Gahanna, City of 2,800 $75.58 $78.00 $71.44) $69.44) $78.26 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

27 Genoa Township 400 $75.44 $78.00 $70.69) $68.69) $78.20 $75.00 $73.35 $72.00

28 Germantown, City of 400 $97.12 $78.00 $75.17) $73.17) $91.19 $88.00 $86.75 $82.00

29 German Township 250 $92.22 $78.00 $74.79) $72.79) $89.83 $88.00 $86.28 $82.00

30 Gilead Township 200 $83.80 $78.00 $70.22) $68.22) $74.92 $75.00 $70.78 $72.00

31 Glendale, Village of 300 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96) $92.96) $93.25 $88.00 $90.92 $82.00

32 Goshen Township 600 $92.45 $78.00 $97.69) $95.69) $94.98 $88.00 $92.75 $82.00

33 Grandview Heights, City of 500 $74.73 $78.00 $70.74) $68.74) $78.57 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

34 Greene County Engineer 7,500 $87.24 $78.00 $72.07) $70.07) $89.57 $88.00 $86.01 $82.00

35 Hamilton, City of 3,000 $97.39 $78.00 $76.84) $74.84) $90.97 $88.00 $88.52 $82.00

36 Harlem Township 300 $75.96 $78.00 $70.25) $68.25) $77.28 $75.00 $74.03 $72.00

37 Harrison Township 1,000 $88.20 $78.00 $74.45) $72.45) $89.63 $88.00 $86.07 $82.00

38 Hilliard, City of 1,500 $75.91 $78.00 $70.87) $68.87) $79.39 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

39 Huber Heights, City of 6,000 $85.49 $78.00 $74.30) $72.30) $90.35 $88.00 $86.82 $82.00

40 Indian Hill, Village of 2,500 $97.39 $78.00 $77.59) $75.59) $91.23 $88.00 $88.80 $82.00

41 Jackson Township 100 $92.22 $78.00 $74.92) $72.92) $89.58 $88.00 $86.02 $82.00

42 Jamestown, Village of 100 $85.49 $78.00 $73.51) $71.51) $89.55 $88.00 $86.92 $82.00

43 Jefferson Township 400 $87.24 $78.00 $75.44) $73.44) $89.66 $88.00 $86.10 $82.00

44 Kettering, City of 5,500 NO BID NO BID $73.66) $71.66) $90.17 $88.00 $86.64 $82.00

45 Mad River Local Schools 50 $87.24 $78.00 $75.55) $73.55) $90.10 $88.00 $86.56 $82.00

46 Mason, City of 5,500 $92.45 $78.00 $73.15) $71.15) $92.42 $88.00 $90.05 $82.00

47 Miami County Engineers Office 6,000 $90.69 $78.00 $72.68) $70.68) $81.34 $74.00 NO BID NO BID

48 Miami Township (Clermont County) 2,500 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06) $95.06) $91.23 $88.00 $88.80 $82.00

49 Miami Township (Montgomery County) 3,000 $92.22 $78.00 $74.65) $72.65) $89.98 $88.00 $85.50 $82.00

50 Miamisburg, City of 3,000 $92.22 $78.00 $73.00) $71.00) $90.36 $88.00 $85.88 $82.00

51 Middletown, City of 3,500 $97.39 $78.00 $79.34) $77.34) $93.26 $88.00 $90.94 $82.00

52 Milford, City of 750 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06) $95.06) $93.81 $88.00 $91.52 $82.00



ROCK SALT BID NO. 24-034SWOP4G BID TAB
SEASON 2025-2026 

Low Bid
Delivered price
Pick-up price

Item  
No. Organization Estimated  Total

 Tons  more or l
ess

American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt
Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price Delivered Price Pick-up Price

53 Monroe, City of 3,000 $92.45 $78.00 $97.21) $95.21) $94.12 $88.00 $91.85 $82.00

54 Montgomery County Engineer's Office 10,000 $90.69 $78.00 $74.34) $72.34) $89.59 $88.00 $86.03 $82.00

55 Montgomery County Parks 150 $90.69 $78.00 $74.84) $72.84) $89.97 $88.00 $85.49 $82.00

56 Moraine, City of ( 1,500)             $90.69 $78.00 $73.70) $71.70) $89.43 $88.00 $85.86 $82.00

57 Mt. Gilead, Village of ( 100)                $74.99 $78.00 $69.90) $67.90) $74.92 $75.00 $70.78 $72.00

58 New Carlisle, City of 300 $80.92 $78.00 $71.56) $69.56) $90.26 $88.00 NO BID NO BID

59 New Jasper Township $85.49 $78.00 $73.60) $71.60) $89.55 $88.00 $85.99 $82.00

60 Oakwood, City of 900 $90.69 $78.00 $73.97) $71.97) $90.35 $88.00 $85.88 $82.00

61 Obetz, City of 300 $74.86 $78.00 $76.45) $74.45) $79.49 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

62 Perry Township (Franklin County) 400 $74.91 $78.00 $70.93) $68.93) $79.36 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

63 Pierce Township 1,000 $99.02 $78.00 $96.26) $94.26) $92.52 $88.00 $90.16 $82.00

64 Piqua, City of 2,500 $92.22 $78.00 $74.48) $72.48) $80.70 $74.00 NO BID NO BID

65 Powell, City of 1,500 $74.39 $78.00 $70.71) $68.71) $77.61 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

66 Riverside, City of 3,000 $87.24 $78.00 $74.32) $72.32) $89.55 $88.00 $85.99 $82.00

67 Sharonville, City of 1,500 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96) $92.96) $91.53 $88.00 $84.18 $82.00

68 Sidney, City of 1,200 $97.39 $78.00 $72.98) $70.98) $81.73 $74.00 NO BID NO BID

69 St. Bernard, Village of 600 $97.39 $78.00 $94.96) $92.96) $88.82 $88.00 $84.30 $82.00

70 Stonelick Township Board of Trustees 75 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06) $95.06) $91.07 $88.00 $86.62 $82.00

71 Sugarcreek Township 1,500 $81.48 $78.00 $72.53) $70.53) $88.17 $88.00 $81.01 $82.00

72 Tate Township (Clermont County OH) 150 $97.39 $78.00 $97.69) $95.69) $92.20 $88.00 $87.78 $82.00

73 Trenton, City of 500 $97.39 $78.00 $97.06) $95.06) $95.43 $88.00 $93.22 $82.00

74 Trotwood, City of 2,000 $90.69 $78.00 $74.12) $72.12) $90.06 $88.00 $86.53 $82.00

75 Troy, City of 500 $90.68 $78.00 $72.12) $70.12) $83.05 $74.00 $82.80 $82.00

76 Union Township Trustees 2,400 $97.39 $78.00 $95.38) $93.38) $88.58 $88.00 $82.24 $82.00

77 Union, City of 600 $89.16 $78.00 $75.20) $73.20) $88.65 $88.00 NO BID NO BID

78 Upper Arlington, City of ( 1,000)             NO BID NO BID $71.53) $69.53) $77.79 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

79 Vandalia, City of 2,000 $87.24 $78.00 $74.66) $72.66) $88.38 $88.00 NO BID NO BID

80 Washington Township (Montgomery County OH) 2,500 $90.69 $78.00 $74.04) $72.04) $90.28 $88.00 $86.75 $82.00

81 Washington Township (Clermont County) 40 $102.12 $78.00 $97.69) $95.69) $91.24 $88.00 $86.79 $82.00

82 West Carrollton, City of 1,200 $90.69 $78.00 $73.94) $71.94) $90.12 $88.00 $85.64 $82.00

83 West Jefferson, Village of 400 $76.49 $78.00 $72.29) $70.29) $80.16 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

84 West Milton, Municipality of 350 $90.69 $78.00 $75.09) $73.09) $84.78 $74.00 NO BID NO BID

85 Whitehall, City of 3,000 $75.25 $78.00 $71.51) $69.51) $78.13 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

86 Williamsburg Township 120 $97.39 $78.00 $98.92) $96.92) $92.20 $88.00 $87.78 $82.00

87 Woodlawn OH, Village of 600 $97.39 $78.00 $75.44) $73.44) $92.39 $88.00 $90.01 $82.00

88 Worthington, City of 2,000 $74.86 $78.00 $71.51) $69.51) $77.01 $75.00 NO BID NO BID

89 Wright-Patterson AFB                            
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications

2,100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $89.60 $82.00

90 Xenia, City of 1,500 $87.24 $78.00 $72.01) $70.01) $92.33 $88.00 $87.92 $82.00

91 Xenia Township 800 $85.49 $78.00 $73.23) $71.23) $89.69 $88.00 $86.04 $82.00

92 Yellow Springs, Village of 300 $85.49 $78.00 NO BID NO BID $90.50 $88.00 NO BID NO BID



Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Item  N
o.

Entity Contact Name Contact number Email Address Delivery Address

1 Batavia Township Cody Smith 513-918-7293 cdsmith@bataviatownship.org 2401 Old State Route 32, Batavia, OH  45103

2 Bath Township Brad Moore 937-266-1233 bmoore@bathtwp.us 1006 Yellow Springs-Fairfield Rd., Fairborn, OH 45324

3 Beavercreek Township John Schroeder 937-429-3672 jschroeder2@beavercreektownship.org 1981 Dayton-Xenia Rd., Beavercreek, OH 45434

4 Beavercreek, City of Joey Shope 937-538-5540 shope@beavercreekohio.gov 2260 Dayton-Xenia Rd., Beavercreek, OH  45434

5 Bellbrook, City of Ryan Pasley 937-848-8415 r.pasley@cityofbellbrook.org 29 N. West St., Bellbrook, OH 45305

6 Bexley, City of Brandon Hook 614-559-4227 bhook@bexley.org 2777 Delmar Dr., Bexley, OH  43209

7 Blendon Township Matt Newman 614-882-2673 mnewman@blendontwp.org 6360 Hempstead Rd., Westerville, OH 43081

8 Blue Ash, City of Josh DeHart 513-678-8836 jdehart@bluash.com 6131 Interstate Cir Blue Ash, OH 45242

9 Brookville, City of Joe Hamiel 937-356-9140 jhamiel@brookvilleohio.com 700 Arlington Rd., Brookville, OH 45309

10 Butler Township Jeff Barnett 937-510-5684 jbarnett@butlertownship.com 3710 W. National Rd., Dayton, OH

11 Caesarscreek Township Chuck Parks 937-313-6743 caesarscreektwp@gmail.com 2034 E. Springvalley Paintersville Rd., Xenia, OH 45385

12 Cardington, Village of Debra K Fry 419-864-7607 fiscalofficer@cardington.org 120 E. Williams St., Cardington, OH 43315

13 Cedarville, Village of James Kennedy 937-371-6151 villageadministrator@cedarville.us 301 Palmer Dr., Cedarville, OH  45314

14 Central Ohio Transit Authority Bruce Neel 614-275-5809 neelbg@cota.com 1325 Essex Ave., Columbus, OH 43201

15 Clayton, City of Randy Sanders 937-474-2795 dsanders@clayton.oh.us 200 Woolery Lane, Dayton, OH 45415

16 Clermont County Engineer’s Office Todd Slone 513-732-8090 tslone@clermontcountyohio.gov 1. Batavia Barn 4009 Filager Rd., Batavia, OH  45103
2.  Buchanan House Barn 2460 State Rt. 743, Moscow, OH  45153

17 Clinton Township Dave Medley 614-905-1360 admin@clintontownship.org 3820 Cleveland Ave., Columbus, OH 43224

18 Concord Township Nathan Wilgus 740-816-1164 nwilgus@concordtwp.org 7860 Dublin Rd., Delaware, OH 43015

19 Dayton Public Schools Robert Hunter 937-604-6624 rlhunter@daytonpublic.com 2003 N. James H. McGhee Blvd., Dayton, OH 45417

20 Dayton, City of Brian Dahm 937-333-4809 brian.dahm@daytonohio.gov 911 E. Monument Ave., Dayton OH 40402

21 Dublin, City of John A Babyak 614-207-2593 jbabyak@dublin.oh.us 6351 Shier Rings Rd., Dublin, OH 43016

22 Englewood, City of Tim Studebaker 937-836-5106 x401 studebaker@englewood.oh.us 1111 Union Rd., Englewood, OH 45315

23 Evendale, Village of Paula Schababerle 513-563-4338 paula.schababerle@evendaleohio.org 2792 Glendale Milford Rd., Cincinnati, OH 45241

24 Fairborn, City of Buck Smith 937-797-7020 cheryl.ison@fairbornoh.gov 59 Erie Ave., Fairborn, OH 45324

25 Farmersville, Village of Derek Shell 937-696-2020 dshell@farmersville.us 44 Maple St., Farmersville, OH 45325

26 Gahanna, City of Kyle Allen 614-342-4425 kyle.allen@gahanna.gov 152 Oklahoma Ave, Gahanna, OH 43230

27 Genoa Township Lauren Fitzpatrick 614-568-2080 lfitzpatrick@genoatwp.com 7049 Big Walnut Rd., Galena, OH 43021

28 Germantown, City of Jonathan Moore 937-855-7255 jmoore@germantown.oh.us 148 S. Water St., Germantown, OH 45327

29 German Township Jeremy Holbrook 937-855-7881 jholbrook1@woh.rr.com 12102 St. Rt. 725, Germantown, OH 45327

30 Gilead Township Bill Arnold 419-210-4011 gileadtwp1@centurylink.net 151 South Street, Mt. Gilead, OH 43338

31 Glendale, Village of Tom Alderfer 513-678-0207 talderfer@glendaleohio.org 528 E. Sahron Rd., Glendale, OH 45246

32 Goshen Township Chad Meadows 513-722-3400 chad.meadows@goshen-oh.gov 6759 Wood St., Goshen, OH 45122

33 Grandview Heights, City of Marcus Benson 614-488-4728 mbenson@grandviewheights.gov 1260 Mckinley Ave., Columbus, OH 43222

34 Greene County Engineer Eric Miller 937-562-7510 eric.miller@greenecountyohio.gov 615 Dayton Xenia Road, Xenia Ohio 45385

35 Hamilton, City of Craig Koger 513-785-7584 craig.koger@hamilton-oh.gov 2210 S. Erie Blvd., Hamilton, OH 45011

36 Harlem Township Jason Andruzis 740-272-3983 jandruzis@harlemtwp.com 3784 Rich St., Galena, OH 43021

37 Harrison Township Craig Brooks 937-274-6871 cbrooks@harrisontownship.org 2409 Rector Ave Dayton Ohio 45414

38 Hilliard, City of Dave Judson 614-334-2586 djudson@hilliardohio.gov 3800 Municipal Way, Hilliard, Ohio 43026

39 Huber Heights, City of Michael Gray 937-233-1562 mgray@hhoh.org 7020 Brandt Pike, Huber Heights, OH

40 Indian Hill, Village of David Yeager 513-623-2722 dyeager@indianhill.gov 7100 Glendale Milford Road, Milford, OH 45150

41 Jackson Township Doug Pohl 937-824-0139 dpohl@jtwpmc.com 316 W. Walnut St.,  Farmersville, OH 45325

42 Jamestown, Village of Gordy Sargent 937-675-5311 jamestown.villageoffice@gmail.com 10 Verity St., Jamestown, OH 45335

43 Jefferson Township Kenneth Smith 937-672-7140 ksmith@jeffersontwp.net 1495 S. Union Rd., Dayton, OH 45417

44 Kettering, City of Greg Moore 937-296-2472 greg.moore@ketteringoh.org 2800 Acorn Drive, Kettering, OH 45419

45 Mad River Local Schools Ryan Fullenkamp 937-237-4275 ryan.fullenkamp@madriverschools.org 1841 Harshman Rd., Riverside, OH 45424

46 Mason, City of Patti Workman 513-229-8580 pworkman@masonoh.org 3487 Mason-Morrow-Millgrove Rd., Mason, OH 45040

47 Miami County Engineers Office Laura Penny 937-440-5656 lpenny@miamicountyohio.gov 2100 North Country Road 25A, Troy, OH 45373

48 Miami Township (Clermont County) Chris Burdsall 513-283-3183 chris.burdsall@miamitwpoh.gov 5900 McPicken Dr., Milford, OH 45150

49 Miami Township (Montgomery County) Wesley Wade 937-608-7366 wwade@miamitownship.com 10891 Wood Rd., Miamisburg, OH 45342

50 Miamisburg, City of Justin Greer 937-603-4620 justin.greer@cityofmiamisburg.com 600 N. Main St., Miamisburg, OH 45342

51 Middletown, City of Charlie Anderson 513-425-7953 charliea@cityofmiddletown.org 400 N. Main St., Middletwon, OH 45042

52 Milford, City of Ed Hackmeister 513-473-9317 ehackmeister@milfordohio.org 840 Garfield Ave., Milford, OH 45150

53 Monroe, City of Jason Holbrook 513-630-7966 holbrookj@monroeohio.org 1000 Holman Ave., Monroe, OH 45050

54 Montgomery County Engineer's Office Mark Moon 937-269-2239 moonm@mccohio.org 5625 Little Richmond Rd., Dayton, OH 45426

55 Montgomery County Parks Hank Stanley 937-776-8014 stanleyh@mcohio.org 455 Infirmary Rd, Dayton, OH 45417
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Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Item  N
o.

Entity Contact Name Contact number Email Address Delivery Address

56 Moraine, City of Chris Dunn  937-535-1041 cdunn@moraineoh.org 4720 Vance Rd., Moraine, OH 45439

57 Mt. Gilead, Village of Derek Allen  419-631-6321 mtgileadstreet@gmail.com 273 South Street, Mt Gilead, OH 43338

58 New Carlisle, City of Dave Coleman 937-765-1581 dcoleman@newcarlisleohio.gov 803 W. Jefferson St., New Carlisle, OH 45344

59 New Jasper Township Phil Erwin 937-286-8443 perwin@newjaspertownship.com 750 S. New Jasper Station Rd Xenia, OH 45385

60 Oakwood, City of David Shuey 937-298-0777 shuey@oakwoodohio.gov 210 Shafor Blvd., Oakwood, OH 45419

61 Obetz, City of Kyle Ingland 614-579-0416 kingland@obetz.oh.us 4100 Orchard Lane, Obetz, OH 43207

62 Perry Township (Franklin County) Ian Warren 614-620-1983 iwarren@perrytwp.org 7125 Sawmill Rd., Dublin, OH 43016

63 Pierce Township Laura Goodwin 513-947-2005 jkoehler@piercetownship.org 950 Locust Corner Road Cincinnati, OH 45245

64 Piqua, City of Brian Brookhart 937-606-0587 bbrookhart@piquaoh.gov 859 S. Main St., Piqua, OH 45356

65 Powell, City of D. Grant Crawford 614-885-5380 gcrawford@cityofpowell.us 260 Adventure Park Dr., Powell, OH 43065

66 Riverside, City of Jim Reherman 937-371-1543 jreherman@riversideoh.gov 1791 Harshman Rd., Riverside, OH 45424

67 Sharonville, City of Steve Busam 513-563-1177 sbusam@cityofsharonville.com 10900 Reading Rd., Sharonville, OH 45241

68 Sidney, City of Brian Green 937-498-8159 bgreen@sidneyoh.com 415 S. Vandemark Rd., Sidney, OH

69 St. Bernard, Village of Don Middendorf 513-242-0086 servicedepartment@cityofstbernard.org 5230 Vine St., St. Bernard, OH 45217

70 Stonelick Township Jason Phillips 513-462-5652 jevans@stonelicktwp.org 2541 US50, Batavia, OH 45103

71 Sugarcreek Township Barry Tiffany 937-848-8426 btiffany@sugarcreekoh.us 2090 Ferry Rd., Bellbrook, OH 45305

72 Tate Township (Clermont County OH) Ed Stanley 513-646-4756 estanley@tatetownship.org 2655 Spring Street Bethel, OH 45106

73 Trenton, City of Brad Baker 513-678-7110 bbaker@trentonoh.gov 215 S MiamiSt, Trenton, OH 45067

74 Trotwood, City of Hope Figgers 937-837-1702 hfiggers@trotwood.org 2400 Olive Rd., Trotwood, OH 45426

75 Troy, City of Justin Olivieri 937-573-9545 justin.olivieri@troyohio.gov 1400 Experiment Farm Rd., Troy, OH 45373

76 Union Township Trustees Matt Taylor 513-276-2070 mtaylor@union-township.oh.us 4722 Summerside Rd. (Clepper Park), Cincinnati, OH 45244

77 Union, City of Rob Bergman 937-836-8624 rbergman@unionoh.org 216 Shaw Rd., Union, OH 45322

78 Upper Arlington, City of Katy Rees  614-583-5356 krees@uaoh.net 4100 Roberts Road, Columbus, OH 43228

79 Vandalia, City of Jake Hayslett 937-415-2247 jhayslett@vandaliaohio.org 97 Clubhouse Way, Vandalia, OH 45377

80 Washington Township (Clermont County) Alan Dodson / 
Robin Brewer

513-316-3382 /
513-553-2072

rbrewer@washintontwpclermont.org 2238 State Rt. 756, Moscow, OH 45153

81 Washington Township (Montgomery County) Zach Trent 937-433-0152 zach.trent@washingtontwp.org 8200 McEwen Road, Washington Township, OH 45458

82 West Carrollton, City of Greg Perkins 937-847-6075 gperkins@westcarrollton.org 250 N. Miami Ave., West Carrollton, OH 45449

83 West Jefferson, Village of Brian Farley 614-813-6674 bfarley@westjeffersonohio.gov 81 N. Heath St., West Jefferson, OH 43162

84 West Milton, Municipality of Ben Herron 937-604-1061 herron@westmiltonohio.gov 125 N. Jefferson St., West Milton, OH 45383

85 Whitehall, City of Jeffrey Hart 614-205-7258 jeff.hart@whitehall-oh.us 4605 Poth Rd., Whitehall, OH 43213

86 Williamsburg Township Brian Tatman 513-638-9900 btatman@williamsburgtownship.org 222 North Eighth Street Williamsburg, OH 45176

87 Woodlawn OH, Village of Victoria Banks 513-866-1251 vbanks@beautifulwoodlawn.us 130 Marion Road, Cincinnati, OH 45215

88 Worthington, City of Derek Stromski 614-431-2425 derek.stromski@worthington.org 380 Highland Avenue, Worthington, OH 43085

89 Wright-Patterson AFB                            
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications

Greg Wheelock 937-904-2390 greg.wheelock.1@us.af.mil Bldg. 30029OHP (Area A salt barn) and 
Bldg. 20614OHP (Area B salt barn)

90 Xenia, City of Ray Ferrell 937-376-7265 rferrell@cityofxenia.org 966 Towler Road, Xenia, OH 45385

91 Xenia Township Jim Pile 937-239-0857 jpile@xeniatownship.org 125 Fairground Rd, Xenia, OH 45385

92 Village of Yellow Springs Tanner Bussey 937-605-9305 tbussey@yso.com 1060 State Rt. 343, Yellow Springs, OH 45387
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Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Item  N
o.

Entity

1 Batavia Township

2 Bath Township

3 Beavercreek Township

4 Beavercreek, City of

5 Bellbrook, City of

6 Bexley, City of

7 Blendon Township

8 Blue Ash, City of

9 Brookville, City of

10 Butler Township

11 Caesarscreek Township

12 Cardington, Village of

13 Cedarville, Village of

14 Central Ohio Transit Authority

15 Clayton, City of

16 Clermont County Engineer’s Office

17 Clinton Township

18 Concord Township

19 Dayton Public Schools

20 Dayton, City of

21 Dublin, City of

22 Englewood, City of

23 Evendale, Village of

24 Fairborn, City of

25 Farmersville, Village of

26 Gahanna, City of

27 Genoa Township

28 Germantown, City of

29 German Township

30 Gilead Township

31 Glendale, Village of

32 Goshen Township

33 Grandview Heights, City of

34 Greene County Engineer

35 Hamilton, City of

36 Harlem Township

37 Harrison Township

38 Hilliard, City of

39 Huber Heights, City of

40 Indian Hill, Village of

41 Jackson Township

42 Jamestown, Village of

43 Jefferson Township

44 Kettering, City of

45 Mad River Local Schools

46 Mason, City of

47 Miami County Engineers Office

48 Miami Township (Clermont County)

49 Miami Township (Montgomery County)

50 Miamisburg, City of

51 Middletown, City of

52 Milford, City of

53 Monroe, City of

54 Montgomery County Engineer's Office

55 Montgomery County Parks

Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Invoicing Address

1535 Clough Pike, Batavia, OH  45103

1006 Yellow Springs-Fairfield Rd., Fairborn, OH 45324

851 Orchard Lane, Beavercreek, OH 45434

789 Orchard Lane, Beavercreek, OH 45434

29 N. West St., Bellbrook, OH 45305

2777 Delmar Dr., Bexley, OH  43209 (service@bexley.org)

6360 Hempstead Rd., Westerville, OH 43081

6131 Interstate Cir Blue Ash, OH 45242

301 Sycamore St. P O Box 10, Brookville, OH  45309

3710 W. National Rd., Dayton, OH

2034 E. Springvalley Paintersville Rd., Xenia, OH 45385

P.O. Box 10, Cardington, OH 43315

P.O. Box 51, Cedarville, OH  45314

33 N. High St. Columbus OH 43215 

6996 Taywood Rd., Englewood, OH 45322

2381 Clermont Center Drive, Batavia, OH  45103

3820 Cleveland Ave., Columbus, OH 43224

6385 Home Rd., Delaware, OH 43015

136 S. Ludlow St. Dayton, OH 45402

911 E. Monument Ave., Dayton OH 40402

6555 Shier Rings Rd., Dublin, OH 43016

333 W National Rd., Englewood, OH 45322

10500 Reading Road, Cincinnati, OH

44 W. Hebble Ave., Fairborn, OH 45324

117 E. Walnut St., Farmersville, OH 45325

200 S Hamilton Rd, Gahanna, OH 43230

Genoa Township Maintenance Dept. 7049 Big Walnut Rd., Galena, OH 43021

1 N. Plum St., Germantown, OH 45327

12102 St. Rt. 725, Germantown, OH 45327

151 South Street, Mt. Gilead, OH 43338

30 Village Square, Glendale, OH 45246

6757 Goshen Rd., Goshen, OH 45122

1260 Mckinley Ave., Columbus, OH 43222

615 Dayton Xenia Road, Xenia Ohio 45385

2210 S. Erie Blvd., Hamilton, OH 45011

3883 S. St. Rt. 605, Galena, OH 43021

2409 Rector Ave Dayton Ohio 45414

3800 Municipal Way, Hilliard, Ohio 43026

7020 Brandt Pike, Huber Heights, OH

6525 Drake Road, Cincinnati, OH 45243

49 E. Walnut St., Farmersville, OH 45325

84 Seaman Dr., Jamestown, OH 45335

580 Calumet Lane, Dayton, OH 45417

3600 Shroyer Road, Kettering, OH 45429

801 Old Harshman Rd., Riverside, OH 45431

6000 Mason-Montgomery Rd., Mason, OH 45040

2100 North Country Road 25A, Troy, OH 45373

6007 Meijer Drive, Milford, OH 45150

10891 Wood Rd., Miamisburg, OH 45342

600 N. Main St., Miamisburg, OH 45342

400 N. Main St., Middletwon, OH 45042

745 Cebter Street Suite 200, Milford, OH 45150

233 S. Main St., PO Box 330, Monroe, OH 45050

451 W. Third St., Dayton, OH 45422

455 Infirmary Rd, Dayton, OH 45417



Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Item  N
o.

Entity

Rock Salt Delivery and Invoicing Information 
Seasons 2024-2025 and 2025-2026

Invoicing Address

56 Moraine, City of

57 Mt. Gilead, Village of

58 New Carlisle, City of

59 New Jasper Township

60 Oakwood, City of

61 Obetz, City of

62 Perry Township (Franklin County)

63 Pierce Township

64 Piqua, City of

65 Powell, City of

66 Riverside, City of

67 Sharonville, City of

68 Sidney, City of

69 St. Bernard, Village of

70 Stonelick Township

71 Sugarcreek Township

72 Tate Township (Clermont County OH)

73 Trenton, City of

74 Trotwood, City of

75 Troy, City of

76 Union Township Trustees

77 Union, City of

78 Upper Arlington, City of

79 Vandalia, City of

80 Washington Township (Clermont County)

81 Washington Township (Montgomery County)

82 West Carrollton, City of

83 West Jefferson, Village of

84 West Milton, Municipality of

85 Whitehall, City of

86 Williamsburg Township

87 Woodlawn OH, Village of

88 Worthington, City of

89 Wright-Patterson AFB                            
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications

90 Xenia, City of

91 Xenia Township

92 Village of Yellow Springs

4200 Dryden Rd., Moraine, OH 45439

72 West High Street, Mt. Gilead, OH 43338

331 S. Church St., New Carlisle, OH 45344

750 S. New Jasper Station Rd Xenia, OH 45385

210 Shafor Blvd., Oakwood, OH 45419

4175 Alum Creek Drive, Obetz, OH 43207

7125 Sawmill Rd., Dublin, OH 43016

950 Locust Corner Road Cincinnati, OH 45245

201 W. Water St., Piqua, OH 45356

47 Hall St., Powell, OH 43065

5200 Springfield St., Ste. 100, Riverside, OH 45431

10900 Reading Rd., Sharonville, OH 45241

415 S. Vandemark Rd., Sidney, OH

110 Washington Ave., St. Bernard, OH 45217

PO Box 37, Owensville, OH 45160

2090 Ferry Rd., Bellbrook, OH 45305

2821 Dean Rd., Bethel, OH 45106

11 E State Street, Trenton, OH 45067

3035 Olive Rd., Trotwood, OH 45426

1400 Experiment Farm Rd., Troy, OH 45373

4350 Aicholtz Rd., Cincinnati, OH 45245

118 N. Main St., Union, OH 45322

4100 Roberts Road, Columbus, OH 43228

333 Bohanan Dr., Vandalia, OH 45377

2238 State Rt. 756, Moscow, OH 45153

8200 McEwen Road, Washington Township, OH 45458

300 E. Central Ave., West Carrollton, OH 45449

21 E. Main St., West Jefferson, OH 43162

701 S. Miami St.., West Milton, OH 45383

360 S. Yearling Rd., Whitehall, OH 43213

824 Gay Street Williamsburg, OH 45176

10141 Woodlawn Blvd., Cincinnati, OH 45215

380 Highland Avenue, Worthington, OH 43085

107 E. Main St., Xenia, OH 45385

8 Brush Row Rd, Xenia, OH 45385

100 Dayton St., Yellow Springs, OH 45387 (invoice@yso.com)



SWOP4G ROCK SALT BID 24-034SWOP4G 
SEASONS 2024/2025 and 2025/2026

STOCKPILE/MINE LOCATION
Item  N

o. Organization American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt

1 Batavia Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

2 Bath Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

3 Beavercreek Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

4 Beavercreek, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

5 Bellbrook, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

6 Bexley, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

7 Blendon Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

8 Blue Ash, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

9 Brookville, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

10 Butler Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

11 Caesarscreek Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA

12 Cardington, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Sandusky, OH/Fairport, OH

13 Cedarville, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

14 Central Ohio Transit Authority Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

15 Clayton, City of Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

16 Clermont County Engineer’s Office North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

17 Clinton Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

18 Concord Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

19 Dayton Public Schools Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

20 Dayton, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

21 Dublin, City of Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

22 Englewood, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

23 Evendale, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

24 Fairborn, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

25 Farmersville, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

26 Gahanna, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

27 Genoa Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Sandusky, OH/Fairport, OH

28 Germantown, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

29 German Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

30 Gilead Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Sandusky, OH/Fairport, OH

31 Glendale, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

32 Goshen Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

33 Grandview Heights, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

34 Greene County Engineer Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

35 Hamilton, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

36 Harlem Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Sandusky, OH/Fairport, OH

37 Harrison Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

38 Hilliard, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

39 Huber Heights, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

40 Indian Hill, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

41 Jackson Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

42 Jamestown, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

43 Jefferson Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

44 Kettering, City of Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

45 Mad River Local Schools Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

46 Mason, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

47 Miami County Engineers Office Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Toledo, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

48 Miami Township (Clermont County) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

49 Miami Township (Montgomery County) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

50 Miamisburg, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

51 Middletown, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

52 Milford, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

53 Monroe, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA



SWOP4G ROCK SALT BID 24-034SWOP4G 
SEASONS 2024/2025 and 2025/2026

STOCKPILE/MINE LOCATION
Item  N

o. Organization American Rock Salt Cargill Compass Minerals Morton Salt

54 Montgomery County Engineer's Office Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

55 Montgomery County Parks Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

56 Moraine, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

57 Mt. Gilead, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Sandusky, OH/Fairport, OH

58 New Carlisle, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA

59 New Jasper Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

60 Oakwood, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio North Bend, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

61 Obetz, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

62 Perry Township (Franklin County) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

63 Pierce Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

64 Piqua, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Toledo, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

65 Powell, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

66 Riverside, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

67 Sharonville, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

68 Sidney, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Toledo, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

69 St. Bernard, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

70 Stonelick Township Board of Trustees Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

71 Sugarcreek Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

72 Tate Township (Clermont County OH) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

73 Trenton, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

74 Trotwood, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

75 Troy, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Toledo, OH/Goderich, ON, CA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

76 Union Township Trustees Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

77 Union, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA

78 Upper Arlington, City of Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

79 Vandalia, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA

80 Washington Township (Montgomery County OH) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

81 Washington Township (Clermont County) Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

82 West Carrollton, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

83 West Jefferson, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

84 West Milton, Municipality of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Toledo, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

85 Whitehall, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

86 Williamsburg Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY North Bend, Ohio/ Chile Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

87 Woodlawn OH, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

88 Worthington, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Sandusky, OH/Goderich, ON, CA

89 Wright-Patterson AFB                            
**See item 15.0 in General Specifications

N/A N/A Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

90 Xenia, City of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

91 Xenia Township Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY Columbus, Ohio/ Cleveland, Ohio Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA Cincinnati, OH/Weeks Island, LA

92 Yellow Springs, Village of Columbus, OH / Hampton Corners, NY N/A Cincinnati, OH/Cote Blanche, LA



VENDOR CONTACT INFORMATION
Name Contact No. Email address

American Rock Salt Co., LLC Jamie McClain 888-762-7258 jamie.mcclain@americanrocksalt.com
Customer Service 888-762-7258 customerservice@americanrocksalt.com

Cargill, Incorporated - Salt, Road Safety Hailey Elson / Customer Care 800-600-7258 salt_customerroadsafety@cargill.com

Compass Minerals America, Inc. Jason Fritz 800-323-1641 highwaygroup@compassminerals.com
Customer Experience Specialist 800-323-1641 highwayorders@compassminerals.com

Morton Salt, Inc. Theresa Szatkowski 313-488-1918 bids@mortonsalt.com / tszatkowski@mortonsalt.com
Customer Service 855-665-4540 buyroadsalt@mortonsalt.com
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